Re: Bills ready to be reviewed

Subject: Re: Bills ready to be reviewed

From: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>

Date: 01/23/2017 12:01 PM

To: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>, Marcus Lieber
<Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>

Sure that works.

Thanks

From: Robert Buente <bbuente@l0lQdev.org>

Date: Monday, January 23, 2017 at 11:51 AM

To: Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la>, Marcus Lieber <Marcus.lLieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Subject: RE: Bills ready to be reviewed

Ellen:

Why don’t you reload your TAP card on a monthly basis and only invoice once. That sounds
easier to me. What do you think Marcus?

Bob

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation
1001 South Hope Street

First Floor

Los Angeles, CA 90015

bbuente@l0l0dev.org <mailto:bbuente@l0l0dev.org>

213-749-0214 x202 (o)

213-749-3098 (f)
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Re: Bills ready to be reviewed

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la]
Sent: Monday, January 23, 2017 11:25 AM

To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@l@lOdev.org>

Subject: Bills ready to be reviewed

Hi Marcus,

Bills have been uploaded and are ready for review. One thing to note: I’'ve started taking
Metro to work. I'd like to include a flat charge on my reimbursements each pay period of
$35 ($1.75*2*10). Let me know if you see any issues with this.

Thanks,

Ellen

Ellen Riotto

Interim Executive Director

South Park Business Improvement District
1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la> | o. 213 663 1112 | c. 401 439 8147

southparl.la | fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles <http://fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles> |
Twitter/Instagram @SouthParkLA
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Re: Bills ready to be reviewed
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